
The Rishi AKA Con Artist Devra Patton West.  
  

We shine a spotlight on her accomplice of 21 years Dr. Julio E Williams MD.  Guilty of funding 
organized crime, directly involved in fraud and extortion and complicit in attempted murder. 

 

 
 

Above from left to right:  Cult gang member Geoffrey Reynolds CPA announced the whistleblower’s murder a week before 
Patton West made a failed attempt on his life.  Patton West guilty of racketeering and murder in three western states.  Dr. Julio 

E Williams MD a 21 year disciple of Patton West’s unaccredited school for occult studies.  He wants to be just like her! 
 

Patton West was chased out of New Mexico in 1995 by one victim at the point of a gun.  Was forced to leave Montana in 2010 
after multiple appearances in court as the defendant in fraud related lawsuits, two arrest warrants and a conviction for assault.  
She was also forced to sell all her assets at a Sheriff’s Sale to pay past victims of crime $2,000,000 in court fines and interest.  
After fraud victim John Watson turned whistleblower, put up a website about Patton West’s crimes in 2006 and successfully 
sued Patton West for fraud, she conspired with Williams & Reynolds to murder the whistleblower.  After the 2007 murder plot 
failed, Williams offered to fund Plan ‘B’ and pledged $2,000,000 of his own fortune to bury the whistleblower in lawsuits.  After 
outspending Watson in court and removing the truth of Patton West’s criminal activities from the internet, Patton West to able 
to relocate to Arizona where she is currently masquerading as the ‘Sanctified Regent of the New Americas’ and the ‘Revered 
Executor of the Divine Plan.’  Apparently, Patton West has been planning to lead humanity for thousands of years! 
 
Dr. J E Williams MD and his past, present and ongoing contributions to Patton West’s cult / criminal racketeering gang. 
 
Williams joined Patton West’s cult / criminal racketeering gang in the year 2000.  Twenty one years later, Williams is still a 
prominent member of Patton West’s cult / criminal racketeering gang, in spite of being totally aware of (and having 
participating in some of) the crimes committed by Patton West.  Several listed in the document linked below. 
 
https://tinyurl.com/tbf8wvv3 
 
In chronological order, we list some of crimes that Williams willingly participated in.  In 2005 Williams was asked to show his 
‘loyalty’ to cult / gang leader Patton West by defaming a total stranger (to him).  The stranger, John Watson, was a victim of 
fraud at Patton West hands in 2002.  Watson issued a fraud lawsuit against Patton West in 2003.  Williams and others in the 
cult / gang were called upon to demonize Watson.  This Williams was happy to do.  Below is a link to the statement Williams 
posted on Patton West’s website in 2005.  Note that Williams stakes his HONOR & CREDIBILITY on Patton West not being a 
prolific criminal and on establishing the TRUTH!  The previous link lists the truth! 
 
https://tinyurl.com/2meadbmz  
 
In January 2007, Williams was asked by Patton West to show his loyalty to her once more by writing an expletive laded email to 
Watson whose objective was to intimidate Watson into dropping his fraud lawsuit against Patton West. Below is a link to 
Williams’ email to the whistleblower John Watson in which Williams pledged $2,000,000 of his own money to fund Patton 
West’s legal fees. 
  
https://tinyurl.com/2hzt8exm  
 
Williams did this knowing that Patton West was 100% GUILTY of defrauding Watson.  He knew because a recording of Patton 
West admitting the crime in a 2003 conversation was posted online in 2006 by Watson.  The first link below is Patton West 
admitting the fraud.  The second link below is Patton West threatening to get down and dirty if Watson sued her. She also 
stated clearly that the huge cost of Watson’s legal fees would come out of his pocket whereas hers would be paid by members 
of her cult i.e. Williams which is exactly what happened. 

https://tinyurl.com/tbf8wvv3
https://tinyurl.com/2meadbmz
https://tinyurl.com/2hzt8exm


 
https://tinyurl.com/39mym65m  
 
https://tinyurl.com/kp455jmu 
 
When the threats from Patton West and her ‘disciple’ / accomplice Williams did not deter Watson, Patton West made an 
unsuccessful attempt to murder Watson in August 2007.  Senior cult member Geoffrey Reynolds announced the impending 
murder to the local press a week before Patton West’s failed attempt on Watson’s life.  The weapon Patton West used to 
attempt to murder Watson is the very reason Williams is a disciple of Patton West’s and has remained a disciple for 21 years.  
Williams is learning about the same occult knowledge so he too can use it as a weapon to manipulate, control, intimidate, 
injure, make ill and murder just as his cult leader does.  Follow the link to learn about Patton West’s secret weapon. 
 
https://tinyurl.com/s4vhnxr 
 
In 2008 Watson won his fraud lawsuit against Patton West.   
 
https://tinyurl.com/39c662ws 
 
The cult had to wait for their revenge until 2010.  After threats against Watson and his wife and children and a murder plot 
failed Williams followed through on his promise to fund multiple frivolous (without merit) lawsuits that Patton West launched 
against Watson.  The objective being to silence Watson by bankrupting him where threats and murder had failed.  Because 
Watson had moved abroad for his own safety in 2005 they knew he would NOT be able to defend those lawsuits.  Therefore 
Patton West was awarded an (undefended) default summary judgment against Watson which included an injunction which 
forbade Watson from sharing the truth about Patton West’s crimes in Montana.  With Watson’s website forced down and the 
TRUTH apparently hidden from the public Patton West, Williams and the cult moved to Arizona. 
 
Currently, Patton West is masquerading as the ‘Sanctified Regent of the New Americas’ and the ‘Revered Executor of the Divine 
Plan’ while offering miracle cures for cancer!  Williams has continued to supply Patton West with a series of ‘testimonials’ that 
portray Patton West as a “wellspring of living divinity” knowing she is a vicious and resourceful criminal, a murderer and quite 
possibly a serial killer.  To review Williams’ dishonest ‘testimonials,’ intended to suck in more victims, follow the link below. 
 
https://tinyurl.com/dcz5rvaa  
 
 

 
 
Above, Williams has also made his home available as a venue for fraud and extortion.  Patton West sells fake cures for cancer 
for six figure sums which Williams not only endorses via his testimonials but provides his home for the fraud to take place.  
Follow the first link below to see image posted on Facebook entitled ‘Sacred Sundays with Rishi.’   
 
https://tinyurl.com/2mvvytzj  
 
Another posting on Facebook entitled ‘Rishi of the Great Masters’ is, apart from being full of obvious lies and propaganda to 
facilitate fraud, alleges Patton West is able to deliver ‘Divine Grace Healings.’  She cannot describe what she offers as ‘miracles 
cures’ that would be a more obvious fraud and might get Dr. Williams in trouble for using his apparent respectability as a 
physician to endorse Patton West’s fraudulent claims. 
 

https://tinyurl.com/39mym65m
https://tinyurl.com/kp455jmu
https://tinyurl.com/s4vhnxr
https://tinyurl.com/39c662ws
https://tinyurl.com/dcz5rvaa
https://tinyurl.com/2mvvytzj


https://www.omniawakening.net/juliowilliams.html  
 
When information about Patton West’s criminal past in Montana started showing up on the internet in 2018, Williams once 
more showed his loyalty to his cult / gang leader by publishing a lengthy but totally false statement on-line which alleged that 
Patton West was the victim of a totally non-existent cyber fraud scam.  Williams even SIGNED THE FALSE STATEMENT as a 
director of the corporation she uses as a vehicle for ORGANIZED CRIME. Follow the link below for a debunking of Williams’ on-
line statement. 
 
https://tinyurl.com/4xvmhjfx  
 
Since arriving in Arizona, Patton West has doubled down on her lies by posting several totally false statements online which 
allege she is the victim of a cyber-fraud scam.  In reality, Patton West was found guilty of defrauding Watson and scores of 
other victims.  However, because she has an injunction (that Williams bought for her) which forbids Watson commenting on-
line Patton West and Williams can TELL AS MANY LIES as they want in support of their criminal activities.  Patton West’s 
criminal racketeering business model relies on the public believing her lies about being a divine being!  The link below 
dismantles Patton West’s lies about being the victim of a cyber-fraud scam. 
 
https://tinyurl.com/nwzn63fp 
 
In 2005 Dr. JE Williams MD staked his honor and credibility on defending Patton West’s integrity and establishing the truth.  It is 
clear that Williams has done EVERYTHING IN HIS POWER to HIDE the TRUTH about past crimes committed in Montana by his 
cult / criminal racketeering gang leader, Patton West.  CLEARLY, WILLIAMS HAS NO HONOR OR CREDIBILITY.  Additionally, 
Williams is aware of the ONGOING campaign of intimidation being directed at Watson and his family.  Williams has received 
over 500 emails from Watson about this matter but Williams refuses to share these emails with the Police or FBI.  The only way 
to STOP THE INTIMIDATION is to ‘force’ a criminal investigation into Patton West and her 21 year accomplice Dr. J E Williams 
MD. 
 

 
 

Finally, an in depth criminal investigation will reveal how Patton West got away with murdering one of her ‘students’ / cult 
members Lisa Swidler in 2005.  Lisa Swidler being a witness to two serious crimes committed by Patton West against two other 
cult members.  When the investigators understand how Patton West murdered Lisa Swidler, they will also understand why 
Reynolds, when announcing Watson’s murder in 2007, had every confidence that a) Watson would be murdered and b) Patton 
West would get away with the murder as she has apparently done several times previously (according to her ex-husband.  The 
investigators will also then understand that Patton West ability to murder with impunity is her justification for masquerading as 
a minor deity and Williams’s apparent worship of her. 
 
 

https://www.omniawakening.net/juliowilliams.html
https://tinyurl.com/4xvmhjfx
https://tinyurl.com/nwzn63fp


 
 
When fraud victim turned whistleblower challenged Patton West by suing her for fraud and by putting up a website about her 
criminal activities in Montana she tried to murder him and when that failed conspired to bankrupt into silence.  In both 
endeavors she was joined by cult / gang members Julio Williams & Geoffrey Reynolds.  Our aim is to have all three tried for 
attempted murder and multiple counts of racketeering. 


